
 

CHEVRON AUSTRALIA 

TITLE: C1281534 –  Onsite Medical Services 

DESCRIPTION:  Chevron Australia is seeking expressions of interest from contractors to 
provide Medical Services on Barrow Island (BWI) and at Onslow.  

Skill set requirements over the contract will include the following: 

 Medical Practitioners 

 Intensive Care (IC) Paramedics 

 Nurse Practitioner  

 Registered Nurses 

 Case Managers 

 Drug and alcohol screening 

Medical Service requirements include the following: 

Primary Health Care 

 Clinical examination 

 Prescribe medication 

 Dispense Medicines 

 Provision of clinical advice 

 Mental health advice / counselling 

 Infection control / outbreak management 

 Adherence to legislative requirements 

Occupational Medicine 

 Drug and alcohol screening 

 Incident reporting and investigation 

 Fitness for Duty (FFD) 

 Case Management 

 Other screening requirements relating to work / environmental issues 

 Wellness program 

Acute Medical Care 

 Trauma management 

 Medical clinical emergencies MI etc. 

 Insertion of cannula 

 Insertion of Endotracheal Tube (ETT) 

 Advanced Life Support (ALS) 

Mass Casualty Management 

 Burns & trauma management 

 Aeromedical evacuation 

 Major Incident Medical Management & Support (MIMMS) commander 

 Supervision  

 Ability to give and take direction 

 Rapid decision making 



 

Infectious Diseases Management 

 Management of individual and multiple cases  

 WA Health reporting mechanism 
 
Additional Background Information on BWI Operations 

The medical service will be over-sighted by the Chevron Lead Medic located 
onsite, who will provide the interface between the contractor and the multiple 
stakeholders on BWI. 

The main medical centre currently sees approximately 100 cases per day. 
The cases range from primary care issues to the acute trauma and medical 
issues that require immediate care. BWI is supported with evacuation of 
acute care patients through the West Australian Resources AeroMedical 
Evacuation Service (WARAME) contract, which includes an Aeromedical 
Evacuation (AME) team and jet located in Karratha for evacuation of patients 
requiring transfer for definitive care and ongoing inpatient management. 

As the project transitions to operations and steady state, medical service 
responsibilities will also alter and there will be requirements for on-site case 
management, screening and surveillance of the various work place and 
potential environmental issues. (See above break-down of the medical 
service requirements). Skill mix of staff will need to be flexible during the 
contract life as the work transitions on BWI. For example, currently there are 
some 8,500 people working on BWI, which requires a number of medical 
practitioners to provide the necessary clinical services, but as numbers of 
persons on the island reduce so will the number of medical practitioners, 
hence skill mix will change. 

Additional Background Information on Onslow Operations 

Pdf to be updated with above information. 

CONTACT: Industry Capability Network of Western Australia – 
www.icnwa.org.au/ContactUs.asp 

 Please Note: 

This is a request for specific expressions of interest. Vendors and 
contractors will be considered for prequalification and / or tender if 
suitably qualified against this package. 

PROJECT URL: http://www.chevronaustralia.com  

ATTACHMENT: NA 

CLOSING DATE: 6 April 2015 
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